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FUN DAYS on the GREEN  2017 

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

The third of our 2017 Fun days is TODAY. 
After a bit of rain on the first Fun Day of the 
season, we had a beautiful day 2 weeks ago, and 
the largest attendance to date, with over 120 
people attending.  The number of children was 
just amazing, and we look forward to another 
beautiful day today!

Check out the pictures!

The children, and others, under the watchful 
eyes of Dan Morgan and Bill Jean and other 
artists have been creating the mural above.

Join us today for more food and fun, and meet 
some of the wonderful people who work to 
keep us, and our neighborhood safe.

Thanks to all who assist with set-up and clean 
up for these events.
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Projects Update 

You are aware, our property, and especially the 
church building, has many needs.  We have com-
pleted required inspections for the city, and have 
a plan of action for the short term, which in-
volves regular inspections and maintenance as 
needed.  We have established a committee to ex-
plore longer term solutions.

We are also exploring funding sources among 
those who provide assistance to historic build-
ings, and we are grateful to those who continue 
to support the parish so generously.

The roof of the garage was replaced this week, 
and we are addressing some electrical issues.  
The irrigation system has been repaired and is 
keeping the property green and lush.

Monday Prayer Group 

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 

The Prayer group has decided to take a break for 
the rest of the summer, and will re-convene after 
labor day.  Thanks to all who have gathered for 
reflection, prayer and conversation.  We have 
been blessed with a group of 6-8 regulars and 
look forward to growing.  See Andrea McGovern 
or Clare Wallace for more information.

Sunday Mass 

Our Sunday worship is so important for nourish-
ing our spiritual lives and our actions in the 
community. Your participation is needed and 
helps the community to grow in so many ways.

Catholic Charities Campaign 

You may be interested to know that St Peter ex-
ceeded its goal for the campaign this year, and 
contributions totaled nearly $2,000.

Thank you for that generous response to the 
needs of people in our community!

Invite from St. Wendelin 

The parishioners of St. Wendelin will mark the 
5th anniversary of the reopening of the parish on 
Saturday, July 29th at the 4:30 PM Mass followed 
by the dedication and blessing of a prayer gar-
den, which includes a new statue of St Wendelin 
and a labyrinth which can help in contemplation 
and prayer.

This will be followed by food and fellowship out-
side on the parish grounds. You re welcome to 
attend, but it would be most helpful to have a 
count of how many will come.

Just send an email to Susan and let her know 
how many will attend.

office@stwendelincleveland.org

mailto:office@stwendelincleveland.org
mailto:office@stwendelincleveland.org


 

Free Food 

Games 

Friendship 

Activities 

All are Welcome 

dŚĞ�dŚĞŵĞ�ĨŽƌ�:ƵŶĞ�Ϯϱ 

^ĂĨĞƚǇ�ĂŶĚ�^ĞĐƵƌŝƚǇ—DĞĞƚ�ǇŽƵƌ�ůŽĐĂů 

ƉŽůŝĐĞ�ĂŶĚ�ĮƌĞŵĞŶ 

dŚĞŵĞƐ�ĨŽƌ�&ƵƚƵƌĞ�&ƵŶ��ĂǇƐ�ƚŚŝƐ�^ƵŵŵĞƌ͗ 

:ƵůǇ�ϵ��-���ŝŬĞ�&ŝǆ�-�Ă�-�dŚŽŶ͖��ƌŝŶŐ�ǇŽƵƌ�ďŝŬĞ�ĨŽƌ�Ă�ĐŚĞĐŬ�–ƵƉ�ĂŶĚ�ŵŝŶŽƌ�ƌĞƉĂŝƌƐ͘ 

/Ĩ�ǇŽƵ�ĚŽŶ͛ƚ�ŽǁŶ�Ă�ďŝŬĞ�ŐŽ�ƚŽ�ƚŚĞ�^ĂůǀĂƟŽŶ��ƌŵǇ�Ăƚ�ϱϬϬϱ��ƵĐůŝĚ��ǀĞ�ŽŶ�dƵĞƐĚĂǇ͕�

dŚƵƌƐĚĂǇ͕�Žƌ�^ĂƚƵƌĚĂǇ�ĨƌŽŵ�ϵ͗ϬϬ��D�ƚŽ�ϭ͗ϬϬ�WD�ĂŶĚ�ďƵǇ�ŽŶĞ�Ăƚ�Ă�ŐŽŽĚ�ƉƌŝĐĞ͘���ƌŝŶŐ�

ŝƚ�ƚŽ�ƚŚĞ�&ŝǆ-Ă-dŚŽŶ�ĨŽƌ�Ă�ĐŚĞĐŬ�ƵƉ�ĂŶĚ�ŵŝŶŽƌ�ƌĞƉĂŝƌƐ 

:ƵůǇ�Ϯϯ�-�:ŽďƐ͖�^ƚƌĞƐƐ�ĨƌĞĞ�ŵŽĐŬ�ũŽď�ŝŶƚĞƌͲ

ǀŝĞǁƐ�ĂŶĚ�ŚŽǁ�ƚŽ�ĚƌĞƐƐ�ĨŽƌ�ƐƵĐĐĞƐƐ͘ 

�ƵŐƵƐƚ�ϲ�–&ƵŶ��ĂǇ�&ŝŶĂůĞ͖���ǆƚƌĂŽƌĚŝŶĂƌǇ�

 

DĂĚĞ�ƉŽƐƐŝďůĞ�ǁŝƚŚ�ŚĞůƉ�ĨƌŽŵ�

EĞŝŐŚďŽƌŚŽŽĚ��ŽŶŶĞĐƟŽŶƐ�ĂŶĚ�

�ŝŬĞ��ůĞǀĞůĂŶĚ 


